PANAMA CITY HOUSING AUTHORITY
PHASE 1 DEMOLITION PROJECT - PCHA RFP#2020-01

FEBRUARY 20, 2020 @ 2:30 PM

ADDENDUM UNIT PRICE FOR
. BID BID 5% | LIST OF UNIT PRICE FOR UNIT PRICE FOR
ACKN.TFORM | torm | BonD | sups | FORM | TRENCH | o ol BASE-BID Demo/Remove | Demo/Remove | o/Remove
REGISTERED BIDDERS NAME EXHIBIT | EXHIBITS | SAFETY Conc. Curbs & ]
EXHIBIT | EXHIBIT | EXHIBIT D-H FORM AMOUNT Conc. Walks PER Gutters Roads/Parking PER
H1 | H2 | #3 | #4 A B C CUBIC YARD CUBIC YARD
PER CUBIC YARD

American Sand & Asphalt NO BID
Break-N-Ground, LLC NO BID
Cross Environmental Services, Inc. X X X X X X X X X 1,989,750.00 94.42 65.30 || $ 98.90
CrowderGulf X X X X X X X X X 2,366,531.00 27.00 29.00 || $ 16.00
Demolition Pros NO BID
GAC Contractors, Inc. X X X X X X X X X 1,857,000.00 20.25 20.25 || $ 49.11
Hauling Away NO BID
Horsley Construction Group, Inc. NO BID
Howard Jimmie, LLC NO BID
intellichoice Builders NO BID
iron Dog, Inc. NO BID
Mclinnis Builders, LLC NO BID
National Salvage & Service Corporation NO BID
ReliantSouth Construction Group NO BID
Royal American Construction X X X X X X X X X 3,029,621.00 108.00 108.00 || $ 147.00
RPF Emergency Services NO BID
Timberland & Minerals, LLC NO BID
PAL Environmental Safety Corp. X X X X X X X X X 2,499,013.00 69.00 39.00 (| $ 83.12
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